
  

     Älmhult Fights Cancer Race, 6 May 2023  

Terms and Conditions for Participation in the Race 

Section 1 (About the Race) 

1.1 Älmhult Fights Cancer Race 2023 (“Race”) is organized by IKEA Älmhult AB in collaboration with 
Elmhults Sport Club (“Organiser”). 

1.2 The Race is divided into the following categories for participation:  

i) 5 Km 

ii) 10 Km 

iii) 21 Km 

Section 2 (Participation and Registration) 

2.1 Every Participant intending to participate in the Race shall be registered in Älmhult Fights 
Cancer registration at RaceID. The Participant submitting the registration must be at least 18 years 
old.  

2.2 When registering a non-refundable registration fee of 150 SEK for 5 Km, 200 SEK for 10 Km, 
and 250 for 21 Km (including applicable taxes) per Participant shall be paid. Registration cannot 
be cancelled or transferred to another individual.   

2.3 Participants can register friends and family members, subject to their consent to comply with 
these Terms and Conditions, and, if the registration concerns a Participant under the age of 18 
(“Child Participant”), the consent of the Child Participant’s parent or legal guardian. Participants 
shall be able to demonstrate such consent when required by the Organiser.  

2.4 Approval of registration shall be at the sole discretion of the Organiser.  

2.5 Participant should not be suffering from any contagious disease, COVID-19 or related 
symptoms like cough and cold. 
 

Section 3 (Rules for the Race)  
Participants shall comply with the following:  

3.1 Reasonable instructions of the Organiser in relation to the conduct of the Race, including any 
safety instructions. 

3.2 Display the registration number provided by the Organiser. 

https://raceid.com/en/races/9802/about
https://raceid.com/en/races/9802/about


  

3.3 Be present at least 15 (fifteen) minutes before the start of the Race and run along the track set 
up by the Organiser.  

3.4 Comply with any laws applicable to the Participants in relation to the Race.  

3.5 Be aware and comply with all traffic rules and regulations during the Race. 

3.6 Not to bring pets or items like posters, strollers etc.   

3.7 Not to obstruct other Participants of the Race or create nuisance. 

3.8 Not to damage property of others, leave garbage behind. 

3.9 Not to display religious or political views or other statements that could be considered as 
offensive. 

Section 4 (No Prize Money) 
 
4.1 The entire registration fee is intended to be donated by the Organiser for charity purposes in 
furtherance of cancer research. As such, there is no prize for the Participants of the Race. 
 
Section 5 (Changes or Cancellation) 
 
5.1 The Organiser shall be entitled to change the date or time of the Race or to cancel the Race. 
In case of cancellation of Race is due to convenience of the Organiser, the Organiser shall make 
reasonable endeavors to reschedule the Race. There shall be no refund of any registration fees 
under any circumstances.  
 
Section 6 (Child Participant) 
 
6.1 Where a Child Participant is registered, the parent or legal guardian shall either accompany 
the Child Participant as a Participant, or make sure the Child Participant is kept under sufficient 
supervision throughout the Race.  
 
Section 7 (Personal Data) 
 
7.1 The Organiser may be required to process personal data of the Participants during the 
registration process and conduct of the Race. The Organiser shall process any such personal data 
in compliance with applicable laws on data protection. 
   
Section 8 (Liability of Organiser) 
 
8.1 The Organiser shall comply with all applicable laws in relation to the Race.  

8.2 The Participants take part at the Race at its own risk. The Organiser does not take any 
responsibility for any injuries, accidents or other ailment suffered by the Participants during the 
Race.  



  

8.3 The Organiser has not procured any insurance for the Participants for any injuries, accidents, 
or other ailment in relation to the Race and any such insurance may be procured by the individual 
Participants.   

8.4 The Organiser does not take responsibility for loss of possession of Participants including any 
possession left behind by the Participants. 

8.5 The Organiser shall not be liable to the Participants for direct, indirect, or consequential 
damages of any kind. In any case, the maximum aggregate liability of Organiser under this 
Agreement shall not exceed SEK 10,000. 

Section 9 (Governing Law and Dispute Resolution) 

9.1 This Agreement shall be governed by Swedish laws. Unresolved disputes between any 
Participant and the Organiser, shall be subject to jurisdiction of Swedish courts.  
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